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From an award-winning Native American storyteller comes this captivating re-telling of a Cherokee legend,
which explains how strawberries came to be. Long ago, the first man and woman quarrelled. The woman left
in anger, but the Sun sent tempting berries to Earth to slow the wife?s retreat. Luminous paintings perfectly
complement the simple, lyrical text. ?Complete harmony of text and pictures: altogether lovely.? -- Kirkus
Reviews, pointer reviewJoseph Bruchac is an award-winning storyteller whose books for children include
Eagle Song, Children of the Longhouse, and Arrow to the Sun (all Dial). He lives in Greenfield Center, New
York. Anna Vojtech lives in Marblehead, Massachusetts.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Elliott:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They are reading whatever
they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't like looking at a
book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will need this The First Strawberries (Picture Puffins).

Michael Earl:

The e-book untitled The First Strawberries (Picture Puffins) is the reserve that recommended to you you just
read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you. The language that author use
to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of analysis when
write the book, therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also
might get the e-book of The First Strawberries (Picture Puffins) from the publisher to make you more enjoy
free time.

Anita Rodriguez:

The publication with title The First Strawberries (Picture Puffins) includes a lot of information that you can
study it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u
to learn how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you within new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Henry Jones:

Reading a book for being new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you
examine a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, since book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, such us novel, comics, along with soon. The
The First Strawberries (Picture Puffins) provide you with a new experience in examining a book.
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