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"Fanatic," "dogmatic," "fundamentalist"—these are the words most often used in the West to describe the
Ayatollah Khomeini. The essays in this book challenge that view, arguing that Khomeini and his Islamic
movement should be seen as a form of Third World political populism—a radical but pragmatic middle-class
movement that strives to enter, rather than reject, the modern age.

Ervand Abrahamian, while critical of Khomeini, asks us to look directly at the Ayatollah's own works and to
understand what they meant to his principal audience—his followers in Iran. Abrahamian analyzes political
tracts dating back to 1943, along with Khomeini's theological writings and his many public statements in the
form of speeches, interviews, proclamations and fatwas (judicial decrees). What emerges, according to
Abrahamian, is a militant, sometimes contradictory, political ideology that focuses not on issues of scripture
and theology but on the immediate political, social, and economic grievances of workers and the middle
class.

These essays reveal how the Islamic Republic has systematically manipulated history through televised
"recantations," newspapers, school textbooks, and even postage stamps. All are designed to bolster the
clergy's reputation as champions of the downtrodden and as defenders against foreign powers. Abrahamian
also discusses the paranoia that permeates the political spectrum in Iran, contending that such deep distrust is
symptomatic of populist regimes everywhere.
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From reader reviews:

Francisco Gentry:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the guide entitled Khomeinism: Essays on the Islamic Republic. Try to stumble
through book Khomeinism: Essays on the Islamic Republic as your close friend. It means that it can to get
your friend when you sense alone and beside those of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is
very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know
anything by the book. So , we need to make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Cheryl Stone:

Book is actually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A publication Khomeinism: Essays on the Islamic
Republic will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can know about every
little thing. But some of you think this open or reading a book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why
they may be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or ideal book with you?

Ciara Wolfe:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This e-book Khomeinism: Essays on the Islamic Republic was filled about science.
Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has
several feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can really feel enjoy
to read a guide. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Freddy Lamberth:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt that when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book Khomeinism: Essays on the Islamic
Republic to make your current reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading talent is developing
when you like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the idea about book
and examining especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a book and go through it.
Beside that the reserve Khomeinism: Essays on the Islamic Republic can to be your new friend when you're
experience alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of these time.
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