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Karl Fulves, one of the most renowned modern writers in the field of magic, presents 67 new and foolproof
tricks — spectacular mental feats that seem impossible but are easy to perform. None of the tricks requires
long practice, supernormal dexterity, or complicated apparatus. Mr. Fulves' precise, easy-to-follow
instruction and many helpful diagrams lead to quick mastery and effective performance of each. Perform
mystifying mental magic in such categories as Instant ESP Psychic Secrets, Slate Sorcery, Mind Reading
with Cards, Mind over Matter, Miracles with Cards, Book Tests, and Psychometry.
Many of these tricks can be done with no prior preparation, and all involve easy-to-find materials: a deck of
cards, coins, matches, dice, keys, chalk, etc. But while the materials are ordinary, the effects are truly
extraordinary. Magicians who wish to add mental acts to their routines, party entertainers, or anyone wishing
to give an amazing performance of mental magic will find this book perfect for their needs.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Goodell:

Often the book Self-Working Mental Magic (Dover Magic Books) has a lot details on it. So when you read
this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles
author makes some research just before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you will get the
point easily after perusing this book.

Melvin Lucero:

Is it an individual who having spare time after that spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Self-Working Mental Magic
(Dover Magic Books) can be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are consequently
out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
guides have than the others?

Evelyn Nay:

You can get this Self-Working Mental Magic (Dover Magic Books) by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just
simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve problem if you get difficulties on your knowledge.
Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book
through e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what
your problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your guide. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose suitable ways
for you.

Fred Peterson:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt that when they get a
half regions of the book. You can choose often the book Self-Working Mental Magic (Dover Magic Books)
to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you just like
reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the sensation about book
and reading especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and read it. Beside that
the guide Self-Working Mental Magic (Dover Magic Books) can to be your new friend when you're sense
alone and confuse in what must you're doing of their time.
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