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Known as the "Great Dissenter," Oliver Wendell Holmes, Jr. wrote some of the most eloquent opinions in
the history of the United States Supreme Court. A brilliant legal mind who served on the high court into his
nineties, Holmes was responsible for some of the most important judicial opinions of the twentieth century.
Now, in this superb short biography, G. Edward White offers readers a lively, informative portrait of this
singular individual. The book first sketches Holmes's early years--his childhood in Boston, his undergraduate
years at Harvard (which his father and both grandfathers also attended), and his valiant service in the Civil
War, during which he was severely wounded three times. After the war, Holmes went into private law
practice, wrote his landmark treatise The Common Law in 1881, had a short tenure on the Harvard Law
School faculty, and spent 20 years as a judge on the Supreme Judicial Court of Massachusetts before being
named to the U.S. Supreme Court. The author focuses on his remarkable 30-year service as a Supreme Court
Justice, beginning in 1902, and details Holmes's most significant cases--Abrams v. United States, Northern
Securities Co. v. United States, Lochner v. New York, Schenck v. United States, and others--which limited
working hours, set a mandatory minimum wage, protected women's rights, legalized labor unions, and
defined freedom of speech. These decisions--as well as The Common Law--are highly regarded to this day.
A new volume in the Lives and Legacy series, this marvelous short biography offers an ideal introduction to
a towering figure in American law.
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From reader reviews:

Charles Grove:

The book Oliver Wendell Holmes Jr. (Lives and Legacies Series) can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. Why then must we leave the good thing like a book Oliver Wendell Holmes Jr.
(Lives and Legacies Series)? A number of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book
can give many info for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or
facts that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you may share all of these. Book Oliver
Wendell Holmes Jr. (Lives and Legacies Series) has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function
for you. You can appearance the enormous world by start and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Willie Collier:

The guide untitled Oliver Wendell Holmes Jr. (Lives and Legacies Series) is the book that recommended to
you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to an individual. The language
that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of analysis
when write the book, and so the information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also
could possibly get the e-book of Oliver Wendell Holmes Jr. (Lives and Legacies Series) from the publisher
to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Anthony Callahan:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you go through a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, as well
as soon. The Oliver Wendell Holmes Jr. (Lives and Legacies Series) offer you a new experience in reading
through a book.

Ian Hall:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This book Oliver Wendell Holmes Jr. (Lives and Legacies Series) was filled
regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some
people has various feel when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can
sense enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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