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Sophisticated banking is vital for modern society to function and prosper. Banks lend to individuals and
corporations but do so after carefully exploring the risks they undertake to each customer.

This book examines the important role of lending in banking operations and how banks can implement safe
and effective loan initiatives. Banks rely on lending to generate profits, but it can be a risky venture. It is
important for banking professionals to understand how to mitigate those risks.

Bank Lending from the Hong Kong Institute of Bankers discusses a variety of topics that impact a bank's
loan strategy. This is an essential read for candidates studying for the HKIB Associateship Examination
and those who want to acquire expert knowledge of Hong Kong's bank lending system.

Topics covered in this book include:

Assessing and reducing lending risk●

Understanding the customer through financial statements●

Using ratios to determine risk●

Setting up an internal structure to reduce risk●

Pricing and managing loans●

Dah Sing Bank is delighted to sponsor this resourceful book. The Dah Sing Group is a leading financial
services group in Hong Kong, active in providing banking, insurance, financial, and other related services in
Hong Kong, Macau, and the People's Republic of China. The Dah Sing Group has gained a reputation as one
of the most progressive and innovative financial services groups. Keys to its success are the strength of the
Dah Sing management team and the group's commitment to serving its customers.
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From reader reviews:

Brandon Francis:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular
spare time to take a go walking, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book entitled
Bank Lending? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time along
with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have other
opinion?

Stuart Rosado:

The knowledge that you get from Bank Lending is a more deep you digging the information that hide inside
the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but
Bank Lending giving you excitement feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in specific way that
can be understood by means of anyone who read it because the author of this publication is well-known
enough. This particular book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand
then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this
Bank Lending instantly.

Jennifer Randolph:

The reserve with title Bank Lending has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain
after read this book. This specific book exist new expertise the information that exist in this reserve
represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the
improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you within new era of the glowbal growth. You can
read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Shelly Sampson:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just watching
TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do you
consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Bank Lending which is
obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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