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This book outlines the competing jet programs during World War II that took place in Britain, Germany, and
the US. The British program was hampered by inconsistent government interest, and little real need, the US
program to develop a jet also lagged because of strategic concern. In Germany, the need for the technology
existed, the innovative spirit of several designers, and official funding combined to produce a combat-
operational jet aircraft despite wartime limitations. Analyzing a variety of primary and secondary materials,
this book provides a comprehensive comparison of the three (ultimately) successful jet programs of the war.
However, only the Germans, even in defeat, committed jet aircraft to combat operations.
Between 1935 and 1945, the Germans, British, and Americans all raced to see who could develop jet engines
first and best, in order to gain the technological edge in the air war and beyond. In the 1930s, as nations
braced for war, the German military build up caught Britain and the United States off-guard, particularly in
aviation technology. The unending quest for speed resulted in the need for radical alternatives to piston
engines. In Germany, Dr. Hans von Ohain was the first to complete a flight-worthy turbojet engine for
aircraft. It was installed in a Heinkel-designed aircraft, and the Germans began the jet age on August 27,
1939. The Germans led the jet race throughout the war and were the first to produce jet aircraft for combat
operations. In England, the doggedly determined Frank Whittle also developed a turbojet engine, but without
the support enjoyed by his German counterpart. The British came second in the jet race when Whittle's
engine powered the Gloster Pioneer on May 15, 1941. The Whittle-Gloster relationship continued and
produced the only Allied combat jet aircraft during the war, the Meteor, which was relegated to Home
Defense in Britain.
In America, General Electric copied the Whittle designs, and Bell Aircraft contracted to build the first
American jet plane. On October 1, 1942, a lackluster performance from the Bell Airacomet, ushered in the
American jet age. The Yanks forged ahead, and had numerous engine and airframe programs in development
by the end of the war. But, the Germans did it right and did it first, while the Allies lagged throughout the
war, only rising to technological prominence on the ashes of the German defeat. Pavelec's analysis of the jet
race uncovers all the excitement in the high-stakes race to develop effective jet engines for warfare and
transport.
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From reader reviews:

Gertrude Barrett:

Within other case, little persons like to read book The Jet Race and the Second World War. You can choose
the best book if you'd prefer reading a book. So long as we know about how is important some sort of book
The Jet Race and the Second World War. You can add understanding and of course you can around the
world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can know everything! From your country
until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you can know
that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You
should use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's go through.

Gregory Kim:

This The Jet Race and the Second World War book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it the
world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is information inside this guide incredible
fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This particular The
Jet Race and the Second World War without we recognize teach the one who reading it become critical in
contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry The Jet Race and the Second World War can bring
once you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it
inside your lovely laptop even telephone. This The Jet Race and the Second World War having good
arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Anna Thompson:

This book untitled The Jet Race and the Second World War to be one of several books that best seller in this
year, here is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy
this kind of book in the book retailer or you can order it via online. The publisher with this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this guide from your list.

Edwina Hinkle:

The guide untitled The Jet Race and the Second World War is the guide that recommended to you you just
read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to an individual. The language
that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of exploration
when write the book, therefore the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You
also could possibly get the e-book of The Jet Race and the Second World War from the publisher to make
you a lot more enjoy free time.
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