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A STAND ALONE PARANORMAL ROMANCE
WITH FREE 10 BONUS STORY INCLUDED
FOR YOUR READING PLEASURE

Sasha Morrows was tired of dating. After a disastrous blind date with a man her sister through would be
perfect for her, Sasha was ready to give it up all together. When her boss calls her in for last minute help
finished the pastries for a Hairy and Fluffy party, Sasha is happy for the distractions. After all, she certainly
isn’t going to meet her perfect man at a shifter party.

Cole Grayson hasn’t taken a lover in quite some time. Both he and his inner wolf are tired of loveless sex,
and he’s starting to think that his mate doesn’t exist. When he gets a mysterious invitation for a Hairy and
Fluffy party, he thinks his mother is up to something. She blackmails him into the part, and once there, he
only finds more women interested in taking a shifter to bed.

WARNING: This ebook contains mature themes and language. Intended for 18+ readers only.
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From reader reviews:

Karen Wells:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Romance : Paranormal Romance: Lion's destiny
(A BBW Paranormal Werelion Shape Shifter Romance) (New Adult Paranormal Romance). You can choose
the best book if you want reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important some sort of book
Romance : Paranormal Romance: Lion's destiny (A BBW Paranormal Werelion Shape Shifter Romance)
(New Adult Paranormal Romance). You can add information and of course you can around the world with a
book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can realize everything! From your country till foreign
or abroad you will be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we
could open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel
bored stiff to go to the library. Let's learn.

Daniel Cadena:

The reserve with title Romance : Paranormal Romance: Lion's destiny (A BBW Paranormal Werelion Shape
Shifter Romance) (New Adult Paranormal Romance) contains a lot of information that you can study it. You
can get a lot of profit after read this book. That book exist new expertise the information that exist in this
reserve represented the condition of the world right now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the
improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You
can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Jose Jones:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright
you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Romance : Paranormal
Romance: Lion's destiny (A BBW Paranormal Werelion Shape Shifter Romance) (New Adult Paranormal
Romance) which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.

Lisa Robinson:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to have a look at some books. Among the books in the
top listing in your reading list will be Romance : Paranormal Romance: Lion's destiny (A BBW Paranormal
Werelion Shape Shifter Romance) (New Adult Paranormal Romance). This book that is qualified as The
Hungry Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking way up and review this e-book
you can get many advantages.
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