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Presenting breadth and depth of coverage in a highly readable style, the 8th edition of this popular survey
text again provides balanced treatment of all the major schools of thought about education. The authors
address how philosophical ideas about education developed over time—arranging their coverage in
chronological order—and pay close attention to historical context, while emphasizing each philosophy's
continuing relevance to education today. For each philosophy, they show its application in aims, curriculum,
methods, and teaching. Additionally, they critically assess each philosophy, and examine how numerous
other scholars view it. The new edition now offers a greater emphasis on women and minorities such as
Montessori, De Beauvoir, Greene, DeBois, King, and West.
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From reader reviews:

Justin Price:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How a lot more to be smart
in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Philosophical Foundations of
Education book because book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred
percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Ray Shippee:

The reason? Because this Philosophical Foundations of Education is an unordinary book that the inside of
the e-book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading
this book next to it was fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the content on the
inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for
you because of not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give
you a lot of advantages than the other book have such as help improving your ability and your critical
thinking way. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were being you I will go to the e-book store
hurriedly.

Lisa Cook:

Philosophical Foundations of Education can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Many of us
recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in
terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The author giving
his/her effort to place every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Philosophical Foundations of
Education yet doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource
info that maybe you can be among it. This great information can drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial
pondering.

Joseph Fulkerson:

This Philosophical Foundations of Education is great guide for you because the content which can be full of
information for you who have always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This
kind of book reveal it info accurately using great coordinate word or we can claim no rambling sentences
included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you
with straight forward sentences but hard core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having
Philosophical Foundations of Education in your hand like finding the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous 1. We can say that no reserve that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen moment right but this
reserve already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt this?
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