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This fifth in a series continues this non-academic author's attempts to decode on a word-by-word basis all of
Joyce's Finnegans Wake. This volume covers chapter 2.2, generally considered the most difficult of chapters,
with the intent to explore Joyce's novel as an art object. This difficult chapter takes us through the human
psychosexual journey of the first 12 years. This journey, critical to the development of the full human spirit,
is a pothole-ridden ride from infant dependency at the breast to breezy adolescent independence in puberty,
from the stroller to the "hot rod." This Freud induced chapter flags the pot holes along the way and the flats
they can cause. The goal of the journey is independence and new possibilities while the flats cancel the trip
and the child stays at home. This chapter is known as the "Night Lessons." These Lessons are Night Lessons
because they are designed to maintain the night, the darkness that prevents access to the new and previously
unknown. These lessons condition their students to lose interest in the realm of the unknown where new
possibilities await discovery. As we learn at the end of the chapter, fear of death is the ultimate Night
Lesson. Death is the Big Flat. This is TZTZ god school--stay in the dark, stay in the known and stay in the
past. Study only what was known in the past. Study each subject separately without regard to connection
across subject boundaries. Wear my school uniform, concern for the opinions of others. Stay separated and
protected from new possibilities. Stay in the old, in "yesternight." This chapter brings us three courses in the
TZTZ effort to protect the known and old from the new: restriction of the enjoyment by children of their
early libido experience, choice and organization of knowledge as fed to children, and the allowable
relationship of the human soul to god. So the subjects are sex, knowledge and the relation to god. If you
think that sounds like Eve's adventure in the Garden of Eden, you are right. The subliminal Lesson Plan in
TZTZ god school is to stall and fix psychosexual development in an early and undeveloped stage, teach only
and maintain strict boundaries between the old subjects of study, and prevent mankind's direct approach to
ES god. As we shall see, this means separation, separation, separation. The Joyce Tikkun tutorial tries to
mend together these important areas of human concern. The connecting threads are like the human
developments in puberty: increased freedom and courage to unify with those separated off as other from self
and the family, the already known. This Joyce effort aims to increase the portion of the united nature of ES
god that humans reach in these areas: puberty liberated libido attraction to non-family members, thinking
across disciplines and new thoughts, and by reaching for god. In this chapter, the union of man and woman
beyond the family is the sacrament of increased possibilities.
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From reader reviews:

Gilbert Johnson:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
when those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you have
the unstable resource then you buy it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Joyce's Finnegans Wake: The Curse of Kabbalah
Volume 5 as the daily resource information.

Larry Parker:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
do you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Joyce's Finnegans
Wake: The Curse of Kabbalah Volume 5 which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
observe.

Marcy Madison:

This Joyce's Finnegans Wake: The Curse of Kabbalah Volume 5 is brand new way for you who has interest
to look for some information given it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge
more you know or else you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Joyce's Finnegans Wake:
The Curse of Kabbalah Volume 5 can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside this
specific book is easy to get through anyone. These books develop itself in the form which can be reachable
by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel
drowsy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a guide especially this one.
You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-
book type for your better life and also knowledge.

Carol Ratliff:

Within this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to do
is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of several
books in the top checklist in your reading list is actually Joyce's Finnegans Wake: The Curse of Kabbalah
Volume 5. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in becoming precious person.
By looking upward and review this publication you can get many advantages.
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