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Silk Flags and Cold Steel recalls the events that took place in the Piedmont region of North Carolina between
late 1860 and mid-1865. Though the skirmishes in the Piedmont were more strategic than tactical, they were
important to the health of the Southern cause. As long as the railways of North Carolina were operating
freely and the state's farms were producing to capacity, Robert E. Lee's Army of Northern Virginia could
move, eat, fight, and replenish itself.

North Carolina's relations with the Confederate government of Jefferson Davis were complex, touchy, and
often antagonistic, for the state had been reluctant to secede and there was strong Unionist sentiment
throughout the state. President Davis never particularly trusted North Carolina, a fact that blinded him to the
state's strategic value. Paradoxically, no state contributed more to the Confederate cause in terms of
manpower and resources than did North Carolina.

From the time he took office in 1862, Zebulon Vance proved a strong and popular wartime governor of
North Carolina. Silk Flags and Cold Steel deals with his tenuous relationship with the Confederate
government in Richmond. It also covers Vance's management of the war in his own state in great detail.

Along with discussion of the political climate, the book presents accounts of the Salisbury prison, Sherman's
march through the Carolinas, confrontations at Bentonville, Raleigh, and Greensboro, and Joe Johnston's
surrender at Bennett's Farm.

The war in the North Carolina Piedmont caused profound disturbances in the old order of things—changes
that led to new attitudes. Those changes created a new environment that eventually made North Carolina a
leader in the "New South" that arose from the ashes of the war.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Brown:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider if those information which is inside former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously
which one is suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Silk Flags and Cold Steel: The Civil War in North
Carolina: The Piedmont as your daily resource information.

Vicky Penn:

The book untitled Silk Flags and Cold Steel: The Civil War in North Carolina: The Piedmont contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains your ex idea with easy method. The language is very easy to
understand all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled
by famous author. The author brings you in the new age of literary works. You can read this book because
you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In
a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site and also order it. Have a
nice go through.

Johnny Grady:

As we know that book is important thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up being
exactly added. This publication Silk Flags and Cold Steel: The Civil War in North Carolina: The Piedmont
was filled in relation to science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your science
competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit of a
book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get
book that you just wanted.

Donna Moore:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or even
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's spirit or real
their hobby. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't
see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally.
As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Silk Flags and Cold Steel: The Civil War in North Carolina: The
Piedmont can make you feel more interested to read.
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