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A book of wisdom teachings and rituals that invoke ancient Egyptian deities to awaken human consciousness

• Provides guided shamanic visualizations to invoke 26 of the most significant gods

• Takes the reader through shamanic portals of death, rebirth, and illumination

• Reconciles internal conflict through a sacred marriage of heart and mind

In Shamanic Mysteries of Egypt, Nicki Scully and Linda Star Wolf renew humanity’s connection to the
ancient gods of Egypt, the neteru. Voices from these divine ancestors remind us of the healing power of the
heart, and call us to bring their consciousness into the present to help us remember our true nature as divine
humans with sacred purpose. The authors provide rituals, meditations, and rites of passage to help us meet
our personal and planetary challenges with grace, wisdom, and love. The shamanic initiations provided are
invoked, directly experienced, and transformed into embodied wisdom that awakens consciousness and
illumines the intelligence of the heart.

Scully and Star Wolf focus their rituals on 26 of the primary divine entities that preside over the ancient
mysteries whose roots are in Old Kingdom and pre-historic Egypt. This fresh interpretation of ancient
mysteries unites the energies of Thoth and Anubis to guide us through the current cycle of Earth changes and
to help us remember who we really are at heart. Through these passages, Anubis lives up to his ancient title
as the Opener of the Way, and Thoth as the Architect of Higher Learning. Together they evoke their power
to unite heart and mind in the sacred marriage that brings transformation, renewal, and the awakening of
consciousness.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Cook:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled Shamanic Mysteries of Egypt: Awakening the Healing Power of the
Heart. Try to face the book Shamanic Mysteries of Egypt: Awakening the Healing Power of the Heart as
your buddy. It means that it can being your friend when you feel alone and beside that of course make you
smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , let me make new experience as well as knowledge with
this book.

Wayne Santiago:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy person?
If you don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have
time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They have to answer that question since just
their can do this. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because
start from on jardín de infancia until university need this Shamanic Mysteries of Egypt: Awakening the
Healing Power of the Heart to read.

Raymond Garza:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the spare time or they
will get large amount of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time,
we will say absolutely indeed. People is human not only a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are
you experiencing when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the
book you have read is definitely Shamanic Mysteries of Egypt: Awakening the Healing Power of the Heart.

Kevin Applegate:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by examining a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book can really hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Shamanic
Mysteries of Egypt: Awakening the Healing Power of the Heart which is getting the e-book version. So ,
why not try out this book? Let's observe.
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