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For over twenty-five years, this three-genre anthology has been a leading title for introductory literature
courses. It provides a comprehensive introduction to the principal forms of fiction, poetry, and drama. Each
section includes a simple discussion of the elements of the form and carefully selected stories, poems, or
plays for illustration. Each section also includes an anthology of additional selections for further reading. In
the Seventh Edition, the tradition of clear, precise writing and practical organization initiated by Laurence
Perrine years ago is continued by Thomas R. Arp, Professor Perrine's colleague at Southern Methodist
University and co-author of the Perrine trilogy for many years. He has used the same criteria of literary
excellence and teaching usefulness that he and Professor Perrine utilized during the years of their
collaboration to select new stories, poems, and plays for the anthology and has updated certain sections to
reflect reader preferences and recent literary interests. Features: * Continues to present the best of classic
literature, along with new contemporary writers. * Organized around the elements of literature within each
genre, the section sare arranged progressively to give students information to understand and use. * Includes
a "Writing About Literature" appendix to help guide students through the process of thinking and writing
about literature. New to this edition: * Nine new short stories and one new novella (about 25% of the total
selections), including works by Toni Cade Bambara, Margaret Atwood, Ann Beattie, Dagoberto Gilb, Zora
Neale Hurston, and Katherine Ann Porter. * Numerous new poems (about 30% of the total selections), many
by women and minority poets. * Completely rewritten chapter on Meter and Rhythm to include expanded
coverage of non-metrical verse. * Several limericks by Laurence Perrine, a master of that verse form. * New
one-act plays by six playwrights, including Vaclav Havel, Tom Stoppard, J.E. Franklin, Luis Valdez, and
Christopher Durang, in addition to classics by Shakespeare, Chekhov, Sophocles, Tennessee Williams,
Arthur Miller, and others.
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From reader reviews:

Cameron Keller:

This Perrine's Literature: Structure, Sound, and Sense book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this book
incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
particular Perrine's Literature: Structure, Sound, and Sense without we know teach the one who reading it
become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't end up being worry Perrine's Literature: Structure, Sound,
and Sense can bring once you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' become full because you can
have it in the lovely laptop even telephone. This Perrine's Literature: Structure, Sound, and Sense having
very good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Terry Carr:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try factor that really opposite
from that. A single activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Perrine's Literature:
Structure, Sound, and Sense, it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it?
What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its
referred to as reading friends.

Roger Waldrop:

Perrine's Literature: Structure, Sound, and Sense can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. We
all recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge
in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The writer giving
his/her effort to set every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Perrine's Literature: Structure, Sound,
and Sense although doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm
resource data that maybe you can be one among it. This great information can certainly drawn you into fresh
stage of crucial pondering.

Thanh Johnson:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Perrine's Literature: Structure,
Sound, and Sense book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
composing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still hesitation Perrine's Literature: Structure,
Sound, and Sense as good book not only by the cover but also by the content. This is one guide that can
break don't evaluate book by its cover, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!?
Oh come on your studying sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.
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